
 

Denial Process for Selective Admissions 

1. In myFSCJ navigate to: 
Main Menu > Campus 
Solutions > Campus 
Community > Student 
Services Center. Then 
enter EMPL ID to search 
for the student. 

 

2. Click the Admissions 
tab. 

 



 

3. Click Edit Application 
Data. 

 

4. Click Application 
Program Data tab. 

 



 

5. Click the plus sign (+) 
to the right. 

 

6. Click on the Program 
Action magnifying glass 
to and choose DENY. 
 

 



 

7. Click the magnifying 
glass next to Action 
Reason. 
 

 



 

8. For the Denial Process 
you will only choose 
between APRE and PRRE 
Action Reasons. 
 
Select APRE-Application 
Requirements if the 
student was required to 
submit a paper 
application to the 
Department but did not. 
 
Select PRRE-Program 
Requirements if the 
student does not have 
the required 
prerequisite coursework, 
test scores, and/or GPA . 
 

 



 

9. Choose your Action 
Reason and click Save at 
the bottom. 
 

 

 


